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Madame Chiang Kai-shek — a Booklist Editors' Choice for 2006 — is the first biography of one of the most
controversial and fascinating women of the twentieth century. Raised in a powerful Chinese family, the
beautiful, brilliant, and captivating Soong Mayling married Nationalist leader Generalissimo Chiang Kai-
shek, and went on to become his chief adviser, interpreter, and propagandist. When the Communists broke
with Chiang’s Nationalist Party, Mayling and her sister, the widow of Sun Yat-Sen, found themselves on
opposing sides of a civil war. A relentless crusader speaking out against Communism well into her nineties,
she sparred with international leaders and impressed Westerners and Chinese alike with her acumen, charm,
and glamour. But she was also decried as a manipulative “Dragon Lady” and was despised for living in
Western-style splendor while Chinese citizens suffered under her husband’s brutal oppression. The result of
years of extensive research in the United States and abroad and access to previously classified CIA and
diplomatic files, here at last is the story of an extraordinary woman who has become a symbol of America’s
long, vexed love affair with China and China’s own struggle to define itself as a world power.
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From reader reviews:

Jerold Richards:

The event that you get from Madame Chiang Kai-shek: China's Eternal First Lady will be the more deep you
excavating the information that hide inside the words the more you get thinking about reading it. It doesn't
mean that this book is hard to comprehend but Madame Chiang Kai-shek: China's Eternal First Lady giving
you thrill feeling of reading. The article writer conveys their point in specific way that can be understood
simply by anyone who read it because the author of this reserve is well-known enough. This book also makes
your own vocabulary increase well. It is therefore easy to understand then can go with you, both in printed or
e-book style are available. We highly recommend you for having that Madame Chiang Kai-shek: China's
Eternal First Lady instantly.

Paul Henson:

The e-book with title Madame Chiang Kai-shek: China's Eternal First Lady includes a lot of information that
you can discover it. You can get a lot of benefit after read this book. This particular book exist new
information the information that exist in this guide represented the condition of the world currently. That is
important to yo7u to find out how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you inside new era of
the syndication. You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Pat Tran:

Madame Chiang Kai-shek: China's Eternal First Lady can be one of your beginner books that are good idea.
Most of us recommend that straight away because this guide has good vocabulary that may increase your
knowledge in vocabulary, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information.
The article writer giving his/her effort to set every word into pleasure arrangement in writing Madame
Chiang Kai-shek: China's Eternal First Lady nevertheless doesn't forget the main stage, giving the reader the
hottest as well as based confirm resource details that maybe you can be among it. This great information can
certainly drawn you into new stage of crucial pondering.

Andrew McConnell:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information
simpler to share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, newspaper,
book, and soon. You will observe that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. The particular
book that recommended to you personally is Madame Chiang Kai-shek: China's Eternal First Lady this guide
consist a lot of the information of the condition of this world now. This kind of book was represented so why
is the world has grown up. The language styles that writer make usage of to explain it is easy to understand.
Often the writer made some investigation when he makes this book. That's why this book ideal all of you.
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