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RT Book Reviews Reviewers' Choice Nominee

From award-winning author Susannah Sandlin comes the fourth book in the smart and steamy Penton
Legacy series.

British vampire psychiatrist and former mercenary Cage Reynolds returns to Penton, Alabama, looking for a
permanent home. The town has been ravaged by the ongoing vampire war and the shortage of untainted
human blood, and now the vampires and humans that make up the Omega Force are trying to rebuild. Cage
hopes to help the cause, put down roots in Penton, and resolve his relationship with Melissa Calvert. The last
thing he expects is to find himself drawn to Robin Ashton, a trash-talking eagle shape-shifter and new
Omega recruit.

Meanwhile, as a dangerous saboteur wreaks havoc in Penton, the ruthless Vampire Tribunal leader Matthias
Ludlam has been freed on the eve of his scheduled execution. But by whom? And to what end? As war and
chaos rage on, love isn’t something Cage is looking for, but will his attraction to Robin distract him from the
danger living among them?
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From reader reviews:

Anthony Parker:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing
for us to find out everything in the world. Each book has different aim or even goal; it means that e-book has
different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They are really reading
whatever they take because their hobby is reading a book. How about the person who don't like reading a
book? Sometime, particular person feel need book after they found difficult problem or perhaps exercise.
Well, probably you will require this Allegiance (The Penton Vampire Legacy Book 4).

Marie Nitta:

Now a day people who Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by connect with the internet and
the resources included can be true or not demand people to be aware of each data they get. How people have
to be smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Examining
a book can help people out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Allegiance (The Penton Vampire
Legacy Book 4) book as this book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the data in this book
hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Margaret Phillips:

This Allegiance (The Penton Vampire Legacy Book 4) is great e-book for you because the content that is full
of information for you who also always deal with world and also have to make decision every minute. This
specific book reveal it facts accurately using great manage word or we can state no rambling sentences
inside. So if you are read it hurriedly you can have whole details in it. Doesn't mean it only offers you
straight forward sentences but tough core information with wonderful delivering sentences. Having
Allegiance (The Penton Vampire Legacy Book 4) in your hand like finding the world in your arm, facts in it
is not ridiculous a single. We can say that no publication that offer you world in ten or fifteen small right but
this e-book already do that. So , this really is good reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs. busy do you still doubt in
which?

Patsy Locke:

The book untitled Allegiance (The Penton Vampire Legacy Book 4) contain a lot of information on this. The
writer explains the girl idea with easy approach. The language is very simple to implement all the people, so
do not really worry, you can easy to read that. The book was published by famous author. The author gives
you in the new age of literary works. You can actually read this book because you can please read on your
smart phone, or program, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to
purchase the e-book, you can available their official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice read.
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