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In this set of devastating essays, Gareth Peirce analyzes the corruption of legal principles and practices in
both the US and the UK that has accompanied the ‘War on Terror’. Exploring the few cases of torture that
have come to light, such as those of Guantánamo detainees Shafiq Rasul and Binyam Mohamed, Peirce
argues that they are evidence of a deeply entrenched culture of impunity among those investigating presumed
radicals among British Muslim nationals and residents, who constitute the new suspect community in the
UK.

Peirce shows that the British government has colluded in a whole range of extrajudicial activities – rendition,
internment without trial, torture – and has gone to extraordinary lengths to conceal its actions. Its devices for
maintaining secrecy are probably more deep-rooted than those of any other comparable democracy.

If the government continues along this path, Peirce argues, it will destroy the moral and legal fabric it claims
to be protecting.
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From reader reviews:

Carl Strum:

The book Dispatches from the Dark Side: On Torture and the Death of Justice can give more knowledge and
information about everything you want. So why must we leave the good thing like a book Dispatches from
the Dark Side: On Torture and the Death of Justice? Some of you have a different opinion about publication.
But one aim that will book can give many information for us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer
using your book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, you may give for each other; you can share all
of these. Book Dispatches from the Dark Side: On Torture and the Death of Justice has simple shape
however you know: it has great and big function for you. You can appear the enormous world by wide open
and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Shirley Kistner:

What do you concerning book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material if you want something to
explain what you problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy individual? If you don't have spare
time to accomplish others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And you have free time?
What did you do? All people has many questions above. They should answer that question since just their
can do which. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is correct. Because start from
on kindergarten until university need this particular Dispatches from the Dark Side: On Torture and the
Death of Justice to read.

Pamela Rhodes:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive now, people
have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and notice
simply by surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated that for a while is reading.
Yes, by reading a e-book your ability to survive raise then having chance to stand up than other is high. To
suit your needs who want to start reading a book, we give you this Dispatches from the Dark Side: On
Torture and the Death of Justice book as starter and daily reading guide. Why, because this book is greater
than just a book.

Calvin Lee:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also become a life style. This reading routine give you lot
of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge your information inside the book which
improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of reserve you read, if you
want get more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want feel happy read one with theme for
entertaining including comic or novel. The particular Dispatches from the Dark Side: On Torture and the
Death of Justice is kind of publication which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.
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